
 
 

Important F.C.C. Sales, Shipping & Use Restrictions – Letter of Understanding 
 

As a distributor Streakwave Wireless Inc., “Streakwave” imports products sold by various manufacturers for use in the 
United States, versions of its products that are locked to United States country frequency channels. These are regulated 
by the F.C.C. as to its use and sale. All non-U.S. models must be for EXPORT only. If non-U.S. product is sold within the 
United States, the buyer must certify by signing this statement that they either:  
 
a) Hold a valid, current and appropriate F.C.C. license to operate that equipment in the frequency range of the 
equipment to be purchased and used;  

b) Agree to utilize such equipment fully in continual compliance with all U.S. regulatory regulations regarding the use of 
such equipment and selected frequencies in any situation;  

c) Agree not to transfer, sell or lend in any fashion the equipment to any other party for use for other purposes contrary 
to those mentioned herein. 
d) Understand that items sold by Streakwave are subject to U.S export control laws and regulations administered by the 
Commerce Department’s Bureau of Industry and Security, the Treasury Department’s Office of Foreign Assets Control, 
as well as governed by Export Administration Regulations and the International Traffic in Arms Regulations, and may 
require a license or other authorization from the U.S Government to be exported from the United States.  
 
Without limitation, anyone purchasing from Streakwave is solely responsible for determining applicable export licensing 
requirements and for obtaining any licenses or other authorizations form the appropriate agencies of the U.S 
Government that are necessary for exporting items from the United States, such as the U.S Department of Commerce or 
the U.S Department of State.  
 
Moreover, the signer below understand and agrees that any purchase and/or subsequent shipment of any non-U.S. 
devices within the United States for other than lawful use and/or authorized export could subject you to FCC or other 
regulatory agency fines and other enforcement action by the United States government, including possible criminal 
sanctions. All products must be used in full compliance with F.C.C. and other regulatory rules.  
 
By signing below, you agree to fully comply with the above mentioned requirements as to transfer, shipment/re-
shipment, sale and use; and to adhere to all United States regulatory rules in regards to the lawful use of such product 
under appropriate license. You also agree to hold harmless and indemnify both Streakwave Wireless Inc. and the 
manufacturer of the product purchased against any action brought against you for any use of such equipment that is not 
compliant with U.S. laws and regulations.  
 
I do hereby attest and agree to the above:  
 
 
Signature:_____________________________________ 
 
Print Name:____________________________________  
 

Date:_________________________________________  

 

Company Name:________________________________  

 

Phone:________________________________________ 


